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Learning Objectives 

 
Introduction 
 
Think about the last time that you had a problem or weren’t 
feeling well.  Chances are that the other people in your life 
helped you out in many ways, increased your ability to cope, 
and got you  “back on track”. Thus, the situation was far less 
serious for you than it could have been.  The same is true for 
people with a dual diagnosis.  Social supports, having others 
there that care, can prevent problems from occurring, and can 
also help these individuals to rebound more quickly from the 
problems that do occur. 

Chapter 11 
 
Developing Social Supports for People who have a 
Dual Diagnosis 
 
Jo Anne Nugent and Yona Lunsky 

Readers will be able to: 
 
1. Define social supports 
2. Describe why social supports are important in the lives 

of persons with a dual diagnosis 
3. Identify how to effectively develop social supports for 

persons with a dual diagnosis 
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In this book, we have adopted the biopsychosocial approach to 
understanding and working with people.  Note that in this ap-
proach, the  “social” element is given the same importance as 
the biological and psychological elements.  This implies that 
social issues, including social supports, should be included in 
any efforts to support people with a dual diagnosis.  In fact, 
they have the same priority as the other two types of factors! 
 
Social support is a topic on which professionals from both de-
velopmental services and mental health services agree.  Devel-
opmental services acknowledge that integration, in particular 
relationships, leads to both personal happiness and learning of 
skills.  Mental health services recognize that social networks 
significantly contribute to mental health.  Therefore, social 
supports have the potential to play a vital role in the lives of 
persons with vulnerabilities, including those with a dual diag-
nosis (Nugent & Spindel, 2000).   Promoting the development 
and maintenance of social supports should be a major focus of 
our work with these individuals, included in all our planning 
and service delivery. 
 
What is Social Support? 
 
After more than ten years of research on social support, re-
searchers are still having a difficult time agreeing on exactly 
what social support means.  Ben Gottlieb noted that with each 
new study, a new definition of social support surfaces 
(Gottlieb, 1983).  Perhaps the easiest way to think about social 
support is that it is the positive or helpful interpersonal trans-
action or exchange that occurs between people.  Another way 
to think about social support is that it is the sense of belonging 
a person has, or the belief that others would be there when 
needed.  This means that social support is both something that 
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occurs “out there”, and also is something within the individ-
ual- a sense or interpretation. 
 
The research literature on social support and developmental 
disabilities offers some suggestions regarding what aspects of 
social support should be considered.  First of all, it is important 
to have a sense of the individual’s support structure and what 
purposes the support serves.  It is also important to understand 
how that individual perceives his or her relationships, espe-
cially when these perceptions differ from the perceptions of 
others.  Finally, negative or stressful relationships that the indi-
vidual encounters are as important to consider as positive ones.  
 
Social Support Structure 
 
When we talk about support structure, we want to know WHO 
is giving support, and WHO is getting it. Questions one might 
ask include: How many people are there in the network? How 
well do they know each other? Sometimes it is helpful when 
they all know each other well, but at other times, it can be nice 
to receive support from separate groups of people with differ-
ent expectations. The positions that these individuals hold in 
the person’s life, and also how well the individual in question 
provides support to his or her network are also important ques-
tions to ask. (Please refer to Guideline 9 on Reciprocal Rela-
tionships for more information on this issue.) 
 
Many individuals with developmental disabilities report loneli-
ness and a lack of intimate friendships with others (Chadsey-
Rusch, DeStefano, O’Reilly, & Collet-Klingenberg, 1992).  
Often, they have no friends who are accessible to them on a  
regular basis.  For example, they may see individuals at work, 
but not know how to arrange to see them outside of work. 
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They may also lack romantic support (Koller, Richardson, & 
Katz, 1988), a fundamental support source for many adults.   
Some individuals with dual diagnoses find not having a partner 
to be especially distressing on both a physical/sexual level and 
an emotional one.   
 
Perceived Social Support 
 
A second area to consider is the perceptions of social support 
that the individual with the dual diagnosis has, especially when 
these perceptions do not match the perceptions of others. Some 
researchers have studied social support from the point of view 
of caregivers, not realizing that how caregivers see the rela-
tionships could be very different from how the person with the 
disability sees them.  Research with persons without disabili-
ties has shown us that what really matters for our mental and 
physical health is not just what support is out there but what 
support we think is out there (Baldwin, 1992; Lakey, Tardiff, 
& Drew, 1994).  Lunsky and Benson reported, as did Clegg 
and Standen, that compared to individuals without disabilities, 
adults with mild developmental disabilities may sometimes 
overestimate their social support (Lunsky & Benson, in press; 
Clegg & Standen, 1991).  This is relevant to dual diagnosis, in 
that when they discover that the person whom they like does 
not care for them in the same way as they thought, a crisis can 
result. Biased perceptions can lead to other troubles as well. 
Aggressive individuals with developmental disabilities may 
perceive anger in interactions with others when the anger is 
not there, inviting further aggression.   It is also possible that 
interpreting relationships accurately can have harmful conse-
quences. If a poorly supported individual with a developmental 
disability accurately perceives his/her social situation, it could 
lead to a subsequent depression.  Thus, it is most important to 
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find out from the individual with a dual diagnosis, or one who 
is at risk for dual diagnosis, how he/she understands his or her 
relationships.  Asking staff or family members alone is not 
enough. 
 
Negative Support 
 
So far, we have not really considered how difficult relation-
ships rather than supportive ones might influence people with 
development disabilities.  We know that they are at greater risk 
for mental health problems than the general population, and 
we also know that they often lack social resources and have 
interpersonal difficulties.  It makes sense, therefore, that they 
are as vulnerable as anyone else when a relationship goes sour.  
Karen Rook reported that the stressful support provided to 
widows was more predictive of subsequent depression than 
was the absence of support to the same individuals (Rook, 
1984).  Similar findings have recently been reported for people 
with developmental disabilities (Lunsky, 1999; Lunsky & 
Havercamp, 1999; Nezu, Nezu, Rothenberg, DelliCarpini, & 
Groag, 1995).   
 
There is some suggestion that the presence of stressful or 
negative relationships in the life of a person with a develop-
mental disability causes more distress than the absence of good 
relationships.  So, when we talk about social support, we have 
to think not only about what positive relationships are there for 
our clients, but also how many difficult interactions they have 
to endure each day.  
 
Often, individuals with dual diagnoses find themselves faced 
with negative social interactions that they cannot escape.  They 
may not be able to escape due to limited options in terms of 
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vocational and residential settings.  Persons with a dual diag-
nosis may also lack opportunities because of the difficulties 
that they have participating in the community.  The lack of 
skills necessary to avoid or escape negative social interactions 
is a second reason why individuals with dual diagnoses may be 
more vulnerable; they do not always know how to get out of 
situations they do not enjoy.  One individual confronted with a 
negative or stressful relationship may choose to appear vegeta-
tive or depressed as a form of learned helplessness.  Another 
individual may choose to respond aggressively because s/he 
does not know how else to escape the negative social situation. 
 
Why Social Supports Are Important 
 
There are three main reasons why social supports are impor-
tant for persons with a dual diagnosis. 
 
Reason 1: Individuals with a Dual Diagnosis want social 
supports in their lives 
 
Whether you talk to people with a developmental disability, 
people with a mental health problem, or people with a dual di-
agnosis, you will find that majority of them will tell you that 
their most important goal is to have social supports.  Of 
course, they don’t use our jargon.  They talk about having 
friends, being loved, and having people they can count on who 
will be there over the long run.  They may express themselves 
through their behaviour, rather than words.  However, the 
meaning is the same.   This is a very valid quality of life issue, 
and for this reason alone, we should include social supports in 
all our work. 
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Reason 2: Promotion of health 
 
The presence of social supports promotes both physical and 
mental health.  “There is a strong relationship between individ-
ual physical-social-psychological health and social supports, 
and between social isolation and breakdown in these areas of 
functioning” (Meyer, 1985).   Relationships can minimise the 
impact of problems, acting as the “first line of coping defence” 
for people labelled as clients (Gottlieb, 1985).  Therefore, so-
cial supports are a key factor in the prevention of mental and 
physical illnesses. 
 
What is it about social supports that gives them such preven-
tion power?  There are both practical and emotional factors.  
On the practical side, social supports can provide a consider-
able number of concrete items such as money, housing, jobs, 
food, child care, clothing, nursing care, fun, guidance, trans-
portation, protection, connections, and opportunities to de-
velop skills.  These tangible ingredients are linked to physical 
and mental health because they help in coping with life and 
meeting our needs.  Never underestimate the impact on mental 
health of losing your income, housing, or independence. 
 
On the emotional side, the presence of social supports can 
boost self esteem, lower levels of anxiety, minimize stress, of-
fer love, increase the sense of security, build strengths, em-
power the individual, instill a more positive view of life, and 
create hope.   We can all understand the importance of these 
emotional factors on mental health.  One woman diagnosed as 
a “chronic schizophrenic” who has lived successfully in the 
community without relapse for many years, sums it up:  “What 
made the difference?  The difference was people.  That’s what 
kept me going” (Neugeboren, 1999). 
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Reason 3: Resilience and recovery 
 
Resilience and recovery are terms used in the mental health 
field which have considerable significance for dual diagnosis 
as well.  Resilience and recovery describe how, after problems 
occur, people can successfully deal with what has happened to 
them and still have a good life.  Therefore, resilience and re-
covery refer to what professionals would call the intervention/
treatment phase of supporting people.   
 
First, we will define these two terms, and then discuss their re-
lationship to social supports.   
 
A particularly expressive definition of resilience describes it as 
“the self righting tendencies” of the person, “both the capacity 
to be bent without breaking and the capacity, once bent, to 
spring back” (Vaillant, 1993).   In other words, problems may 
arise, but resilience is the ability to survive with minimal dam-
age and then to rebound. This is an inspiring concept that cap-
tures the potential of the human spirit. 
 
Recovery is a related term.  It is somewhat imprecise, but can 
be thought of as coming to terms with who you are and living 
a satisfying life, even within your limitations.  Note that recov-
ery does not mean cure.  Instead, it refers to gaining a sense of 
control over life and getting on with goals, coping with the re-
ality of who one is: In other words, the person goes on playing 
the game of life with different rules. 
 
Social supports contribute to both resilience and recovery.  A 
significant amount of research regarding resilience (including 
one study over a 37 year period!) indicates that the presence of 
caring people in their lives, helps children to survive consider-
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able hardships, and to end up living ordinary adult lives (Rapp, 
1998).  Similarly, extensive research confirms that social sup-
ports are an important component of recovery. (Sullivan, 
1994).   Many people say that social supports make them feel 
less frightened and better able to deal with whatever happens 
to them.     
 
Therefore, social supports are extremely important.  They help 
prevent problems, lessen the impact of problems, and facilitate 
recovery.  In other words, they are a part of treatment, just like 
medication or therapy. 
 
Social supports and crisis planning 
 
Unfortunately, people with a dual diagnosis often experience 
frequent “crises” of various kinds related to their behaviours.  
We tend to think that only professionals can be useful during a 
crisis.  Yet, social supports can be extremely helpful during a 
crisis.  As a matter of fact, social supports can minimize or 
even prevent crises. 
 
Every “client” who experiences crises on a relatively frequent 
basis should have a crisis plan.  The crisis plan contains three 
stages.  Social supports should be included at each stage.  
 
Stage One:  Prevention: Through careful observation and col-
lection of information, it is possible to determine when crisis is 
likely to occur for this individual.  We should find out what 
events or situations tend to provoke crisis.  Then, every effort 
should be made to eliminate crisis by dealing with these fac-
tors.   Crisis could be brought on by changes, ill-health, or lack 
of emotional support.  By brainstorming these issues, it is of-
ten possible to develop very effective ways of assisting the in-
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dividual to cope.  Social supports should be included as part of 
the resources that could be used at this stage. 
 
For example, one young woman with a dual diagnosis fre-
quently had a crisis of a suicidal nature on weekends.  Since 
she was living in an independent situation, she only received 
eight hours a week of residential staff support, always between 
Monday and Friday.  There were no crises at these times.   The 
woman then became involved with a Friday night camera club 
and a Saturday square dance club.  These two clubs provided 
her with friendship and activity during her most vulnerable 
time periods, and the crises virtually disappeared. 
 
Stage Two, Early Intervention:    If a particular crisis can not 
be prevented, it is important to step in early and minimize the 
negative impact of the crisis.  We hope to be able to help the 
person before his/her behaviour is dangerous, to keep him/her 
in the community, to maintain his/her dignity, and to build 
supports for next time.   Once again, social supports can be of 
great assistance.   
 
Another example is a situation in which a young man with a 
dual diagnosis experienced periods of deep depression that re-
sulted in self-injurious behaviour.  Changes in staff were a par-
ticular trigger for his depression.  Once this was determined, it 
was decided to form a team of unpaid people who would be in 
his life on a regular basis.   Whenever there was a staff change, 
this team immediately increased their contact with him to pro-
vide him with stability and caring.  While he still experienced 
some problems with depression, his self-injury was less de-
structive, and the bouts of depression were much briefer in na-
ture. 
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Stage Three: Recovery after Crisis: Sometimes crisis does oc-
cur, and we must act to protect the “client” or others from seri-
ous harm.  This usually entails considerable involvement with 
professionals, and intrusive actions such as high doses of 
medication, restraints, or hospitalization.  At this point, though 
it may seem that social supports have very little role, they can 
still have a positive effect on recovery.  Contact with the peo-
ple who are social supports can help the person to stabilize and 
get “back on track” more quickly.   Some crisis plans actually 
utilize with positive results the resources of the social supports 
during crisis rather than simply hospital staff (Carling, 1998). 
 
Social supports have a flexibility that formalised staffing sys-
tems often don’t.  They can be available at any hour of any day 
and at any location, without the restrictions of administrative 
structures such as work shifts.   They tend to be more perma-
nent than staffing systems.  Plus, people who are in the social 
support network often have a better sense of the “client’s” his-
tory, and what works best for him/her. 
 
Social Support Assessment 
 
There are three primary ways to assess social support.  We rec-
ommend that whenever possible all three methods be consid-
ered.  The most common form of social support assessment is 
that of informant ratings.  One way to do this is to engage an 
informant such as a staff or family member in a structured in-
terview (Kraus, Seltzer, & Goodman, 1992).  Such a detailed 
procedure can be very informative, but also very time-
consuming.  An alternative would be a brief, structured inter-
view such as that developed by Meins (1993).  Written rating 
scales have also been developed that can be completed by in-
formants.  One such measure is the Social Circles Question-
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naire developed by Lunsky and Benson (1999).  This measure 
takes approximately twenty minutes to complete.  It assesses 
support provided by family, staff, friends, and romantic part-
ner.  In addition to looking at the quality of social support, it 
also allows for ratings of stressful relationships and reciproc-
ity.  
 
As discussed previously, how one perceives his or her relation-
ships is very important information.  Therefore, it is best to 
measure social support whenever possible via self-report.  
There many ways this can be done depending on the severity 
of that individual’s mental illness or cognitive disability.  The 
simplest way to assess perceived support would be to ask the 
individual to list or point out who s/he likes.  Toni Antonucci 
developed a Concentric Circles Technique which considers 
both who is perceived as supportive and the level of closeness 
perceived (Antonucci, 1986).  The Social Support Self-Report 
is a more elaborate perceived support measure that begins as a 
structured interview whereby the person identifies important 
support people in his/her life (Lunsky & Benson, 1997; Reiss 
& Benson, 1985).  Next, the person rates his/her perceptions of 
support provided by the four categories of individuals listed: 
family, staff, friends, and partner.  A useful perceived strain 
measure is the 40-item Instrument of Negative Social Interac-
tions developed by Lakey, Tardiff, and Drew (1994). 
 
The final way to assess social support is to observe that indi-
vidual’s interactions.  There are several ways this can be done 
objectively. Newton, Olsen and Horner (1995) have empha-
sized in-depth behaviour observations of social interactions of 
individuals with severe disabilities.  A less rigid approach to 
this would be naturalistic observation to see who an individual 
interacts with and how they respond during interactions.  
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Phone logs and activity schedules can also be helpful sources 
of information. 
 
Guidelines for the Development and Use of Social Supports 
 
Social supports are of great benefit to persons with a dual diag-
nosis.   Not only can social supports improve the person’s 
quality of life, they can lessen, or even eliminate, the need for 
costly and restrictive professional services.  As professionals 
we should be ensuring that social supports are a component of 
any work we do.   
 
Many of you may feel discouraged about this.  You may have 
tried to develop social supports and found it to be a difficult 
and ultimately unsuccessful process.  Perhaps you have so 
many other duties that working on social supports is near the 
bottom of your “to do” list.  In this section, we will offer some 
suggestions that may assist you. 
 
Guideline 1: Make Social Supports a priority  
 
It is clear that social supports should be a primary focus of our 
work with people who have a dual diagnosis, not just an after-
thought or a nice “extra”.   Make every effort you can to en-
sure that social supports are a priority in your work.   Include 
them in your own approach.  Educate other people about how 
important social supports are as a mechanism for prevention, 
resilience, and recovery (this Chapter and its references can 
help).   Encourage the organization you work for to recognize 
social supports as a priority.   
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Guideline 2: Include Social Supports in all planning 
 
One concrete way of ensuring that social supports are a prior-
ity is to include them in all your planning processes.   At each 
planning meeting, support the “client” to express his/her goals 
regarding social supports, and to make certain that his/her 
wishes are included in any documentation.   Insert social sup-
ports as a category on any planning forms, and put it at the top 
of the list.   Before making referrals to professional services, 
explore whether social supports could accomplish the same 
goal.  If referrals are made to professionals, don’t forget to in-
clude social supports that could increase the effectiveness of 
professional services.  Every plan for every person should in-
clude at least some goals related to social supports. 
 
Guideline 3: Devote resources to developing Social Supports  
 
It is important to “put your money where your mouth is”.  
While including social supports in planning is a significant 
step, it is just as important to have someone on the team spe-
cifically dedicate part of his/her time to develop social sup-
ports.  This may seem naive to you.  How can a staff member 
focus on social supports while there are so many other critical 
jobs to be done, and so many problems to deal with?  The real-
ity is that developing social supports will only be accom-
plished if someone is responsible for that job!  Keep in mind 
that, over the long run, social supports can save resources be-
cause they foster prevention, resilience, and recovery.  This 
makes it an excellent investment of your time now to work on 
social supports for significant future benefit. 
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Guideline 4: Build Social Supports based on mutual interests  
             
This a basic rule of thumb for success with social supports.  
Look for people who share something with the “client” -- top-
ics they are interested in, people they know, places they go, ac-
tivities they like, their history, or talents.  This could encom-
pass family, friends, community members, and staff.   Far too 
often, we try to force the development of social relationships 
between the “client” and persons with whom s/he has nothing 
in common.  This happens sometimes with volunteers who are 
recruited to be friends.   There is absolutely nothing wrong 
with volunteers!  However, it is far more effective to seek out 
volunteers from the people who already know the “client” in 
some capacity, or who have mutual interests that could be ex-
panded upon.   This is a more typical and natural process, the 
way that we all build relationships.   It is also much more 
likely to result in social supports that will last over time, and 
contribute to the “client’s” well being. 
 
To be successful with social supports, it is useful to: 
• know the “client” well as a person, his/her interests, skills, 

lifestyle. 
• observe the “client” carefully as s/he goes about the regular 

routines of life, looking for any potential social supports 
that could be enhanced.  

• become familiar with the community to have a pool of po-
tential social supports in mind. 

 
Guideline 5: Develop a wide range of Social Supports   
             
There are two reasons why it is helpful for the person to have a 
wide range of social supports.  First, it  increases the opportu-
nities and benefits that the social supports can provide.  Sec-
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ond, it avoids “burn out” of the people who are social supports.  
This latter point is particularly important.   It can be very fa-
tiguing to be one of the few (or the only) supports that some-
one has.  This is especially true if someone has a dual diagno-
sis, since this may result in that person having many needs, 
constant crises, and some unpleasant behaviours.    
 
If you think about your own social supports, you will find that 
you have a range of people in your life.  Some people are very 
close, and you see them frequently.  Others have a specific in-
volvement in your life, such as someone on your sports team 
or your baby sitter. One person may be able to provide you 
emotional comfort, while someone else is a contact for jobs or 
a place to live.  
 
Encourage a variety of people to become involved in the social 
supports of a person with a dual diagnosis with varied ages, 
personalities, lifestyles, and interests.  This will result in dif-
ferent people providing different supports and options for the 
individual.  Also, it will increase the probability that the full 
range of the “client’s” needs are being met – a person can have 
lots of people giving him/her only one kind of support 
(practical), and end up feeling relatively empty.  The breadth 
of supports can increase prevention, resilience, and recovery.    
 
Guideline 6: Focus on unpaid persons rather than staff as 
            Social Supports  
 
Staff fulfill many crucial functions in the lives of persons with 
a dual diagnosis.  Frequently, this includes taking on the role 
of friend.  However, we should consider the proportion of paid 
support providers in the individual’s social network.  Several 
research studies have found that individuals with developmen-
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tal disabilities receive a disproportionate amount of social sup-
port from paid support sources (Rosen & Burchard, 1990; 
Sands & Kozleski, 1994). 
 
It is preferable to focus on developing social supports that con-
sist mainly of unpaid people.   This is not meant to be an insult 
to staff and their dedication to the people they support.  How-
ever, the rationale for this guideline is quite simple: staff may 
come and go in “client’s” lives.  Staff turnover is a fact of life 
that makes it unwise to create a social support system that is 
mainly made up of staff.  Unpaid people, particularly those 
who have a lifestyle element in common with the “client”, will 
be there for a lot longer.  As well, variety is more likely to be 
achieved through a network of unpaid people who would usu-
ally represent a greater range of ages, experiences, incomes, 
life experiences, and community connections than staff would.   
Certainly staff can be part of a social support system, but the 
effective system includes many unpaid people too. 
 
Guideline 7: Don’t Try to Make Social Supports Professional 
            Services  
 
If there are unpaid people who become involved in the life of a 
person with a dual diagnosis, it is wise to avoid the urge to 
make them into unpaid staff.  We have seen many situations in 
which well meaning staff incorporated community people into 
the professional support system.   The community people were 
expected to attend countless planning meetings, develop goals 
for their friendship with the “client”, dedicate a certain number 
of hours per month to the “client”, and even provide program-
matic-like descriptions of how they spent their time together!  
Needless to say, this corrupted the relationship, resulting in 
frustration for the community people who ultimately opted out.    
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This process insults the “client”, since it implies that only staff 
would really want to be part of his/her life.  It also insults the 
community person by implying that he/she would only be use-
ful if he/she were organized and supervised like staff. 
 
Staff members are paid professionals who provide specific ser-
vices.  Social supports are people who relate to the individual 
in an informal, natural, and sincere way.  People will offer 
their time and concern as they can, and in the way that is their 
own style, and this should be accepted at face value.  
 
Guideline 8: Look beyond middle class values for Social   
            Supports 
             
The group of people whom we call clients are a very wide-
ranging group.  They come from many different backgrounds, 
and have many different interests.  Typically, service providers 
represent the middle class in terms of values, education, and 
income level.  We tend to look for social supports that are 
compatible with our lifestyles.  However, it is necessary to 
consider who the “client” is, and what types of social supports 
would offer him/her the most.  This may mean that staff per-
sonnel have to shed their middle class values when developing 
social supports.  The older lady who spends many hours a day 
in the donut shop, or the man who runs a tattoo parlour may be 
an excellent and highly compatible friend for a particular 
“client”.    We must try to see these folks through the eyes of 
the “client”.   Who will offer the practical and emotional re-
sources that will have the most positive impact on this particu-
lar “client’s” mental health and overall quality of life?  Who is 
a good “fit” or “match” for this person? 
 
Of course, we are not saying that it is acceptable for us to en-



Developing Social Supports for People who have a Dual Diagnosis 377 

courage negative or abusive relationships.  However, remem-
ber that social supports do not have to be people without 
flaws!   Sometimes, staff  has impossibly high standards for 
those who would willingly be involved in a “client’s” life.  
Your friends and family probably aren’t perfect.  Yet they are 
a key part of your well being.  The same should hold true for 
“clients” and their social supports.  We should be careful that 
we do not become too demanding of the ordinary, somewhat 
flawed folks who have potential to make a difference in a 
“client’s” life.     
 
Guideline 9: Create opportunities rather than matches  
             
The best way for a “client” to develop social supports is for 
that person to be out and about with other people.  In that way, 
s/he will meet others with common interests.  This is better 
than artificially matching people through getting them together 
in an awkward meeting that has been set up by staff (often 
called the blind date approach!).     
 
Staff’s job is to create opportunities for the “client” to be in-
volved with others.  Such opportunities should accurately re-
flect the “client’s” preferences so that there will be real com-
mon interests with the others present.   This kind of integration 
provides the potential for social supports to be fostered. 
 
Guideline 10: Encourage reciprocal relationships 
             
Reciprocal relationships are ones in which each person bene-
fits from the situation or gets something out of it.   It implies 
that there is a “give and take” to the relationship.  In real life, 
practically all relationships are built on reciprocity.  People 
would not stay in relationships if there was not some benefit to 
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them.  This is not a “bad” thing; it is just human.  Of course, 
the definition of benefit is an individual one, and can include 
both practical and emotional elements.   
 
Some researchers have argued that social support has its heal-
ing effects because of reciprocity (Horowitz, 1996).  When re-
ciprocity is lacking, therefore, social support may not really be 
all that helpful.   This can be a problem with paid social sup-
port, for example, because by nature it is not reciprocal.  That 
means that if an individual with a dual diagnosis receives most 
of his or her support from staff, s/he may not be able to return 
that level of support.   
 
It can be difficult for persons with a dual diagnosis to develop 
long-term social supports since their relationships are quite of-
ten not reciprocal.   In other words, staff typically examines 
any potential relationship in terms of how the “client” will 
benefit.  We look for volunteers who will offer the “client” a 
social life or teach skills.  Seldom do we think of helping the 
“client” to give back in any way.  Over time, one way relation-
ships tend to die off, and that is just what happens with many 
of the social supports that we try to establish for “clients”.   
 
As staff members, we can help “clients” to think of ways that 
they can give back to their social supports and keep our eyes 
open for opportunities.  Reciprocity does not mean that people 
have to be completely equal in their give and take.  However, 
it does mean being considerate of the other.  Therefore, a rela-
tively inexpensive birthday card from a person on a limited 
fixed income expresses reciprocity just as much as an expen-
sive birthday present from someone with no financial restric-
tions. 
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Guideline 11: Teach social skills 
 
It is interesting to consider how important social skills are with 
respect to human relationships.  The ability to behave within 
the boundaries of society’s expectations is far more important 
to relationships than how smart, talented, or unique a person is.  
Nothing will ruin a budding friendship more quickly than a 
person who does not act “right” according to our social rules.   
This holds true whether we are talking about someone trying 
to make friends at a community job, to meet a girlfriend or 
boyfriend at a social event, or to have a close relationship with 
family members. 
 
Social skills can be thought of as behaviours that pertain to 
getting along with other people.  They include proper greet-
ings, appropriate touching, honouring other people’s personal 
space, eye contact, making conversation, using polite vocabu-
lary, developing more intense relationships at a comfortable  
pace for the other person, suitable behaviour with the opposite 
sex, street safe behaviour, table manners, and consideration for 
others.   This is but a partial list.  
 
To increase the “client’s” success in developing social sup-
ports, it is crucial to assist him/her to develop the best possible 
social skills.  Many excellent materials are available for teach-
ing social skills to persons with different levels of abilities 
(See the resource list at the end of this chapter).    If you have 
limited time to devote to teaching skills, it will be the most ef-
fective if you concentrate on social skills.  This will increase 
the probability that social supports will develop, and these so-
cial supports will open the door to many other possibilities in 
the world.   
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Guideline 12: Minimize the impact of “negative” behaviours 
            that might impede the development of relationships  
 
This guideline relates to the previous one.  Along with improv-
ing or enhancing the individual’s social skills, we must be very 
aware of any “negative” behaviours that might make it very 
difficult to create and maintain social supports.   There are two 
options to working with these types of behaviours. 
 
• Option 1 is to eliminate these behaviours.  This is the obvi-

ous approach with serious situations such as aggression or 
self-injury, since these are harmful to the individual and 
others.   

 
• Option 2 is to seek out situations in which the “negative” 

behaviours are not as likely to block the development of 
social supports.   There may be people for whom these 
“negative” behaviours are not important, or places where 
these “negative” behaviours are acceptable.  We are not 
talking about extreme behaviours, but foibles and idiosyn-
crasies that are not the norm.  One example is that of a 47 
year-old man who had an obsession with cars.  He talked 
incessantly about them, in great detail, to the point where 
many people avoided him.  Finding him a job as a helper at 
a large garage eliminated this issue, since his co-workers 
were as obsessed as he was!   Creativity is the key.  One 
astonishing miracle about human nature is that there are 
almost always compatible matches for each person, if we 
think about it.   
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Summary 
 
This chapter has been developed to provide useful information 
about social supports for persons with a dual diagnosis on both 
a theoretical and practical level.  We have included a definition 
of social supports, a review of types of social supports, and a 
discussion of how important the individual’s perception of so-
cial supports can be.  The Guidelines for the Development and 
Use of Social Supports cited above offer some concrete sug-
gestions to use in real life with persons who have a dual diag-
nosis.  They are based on the experiences of countless people 
who have demonstrated the validity of social supports as a 
facet of  “treatment”.  

Do You Know? 
 
1. Why are social supports so important to persons 

with a dual diagnosis? 
2. What are some of the characteristics of effective so-

cial supports? 
3. What role can staff play in the social supports of 

persons with a dual diagnosis? 
4. What are some ways of measuring a person’s social 

supports? 
5. How can social supports be included in someone’s 

crisis plan? 
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Resources 
 
Amado, A. N. (1993).  Friendships and connections between 

people with and without developmental disabilities.  Balti-
more, MD: Paul Brookes 

Carling, P. J. (1995).  Return to community: Building support 
systems for people with psychiatric disabilities.  New 
York, NY: The Guilford Press 

McKnight, J. L. (1995).  The careless society: Community and 
its counterfeits.  New York, NY:  

Nisbet, J. (1992).  Natural supports in school, at work, and in 
the community for people with severe disabilities.  Balti-
more, MD: Paul Brookes. 

Nugent, J. & Spindel, P. (2000).  Creating the context for em-
powerment: Empowering individuals and creating compe-
tent communities.  Toronto, Ontario: Nu-Spin Publishing. 

Taylor, S. J., Bogdan, R., & Lutfiyya, Z. M. (1995).  The vari-
ety of community experience: Qualitative studies of family 
and community life.  Baltimore, MD: Paul Brookes 
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